
The first talk of Dean’s Talk Series on Pathways to Excellence 
entitled “Time as a Resource: Non-renewable but Manageable” 
was addressed by Prof. Dr. Sunil Jha (Dean of FOS & Research) 
and attended by CSAM students. The talk began with the 
scientific definition of 'second', dimensions of time, and then 
shifted to discussing the significance of each second in student 
life, and better time management for professional, personal, and 
social activities. The session concluded by discussing how to 
reduce the use of social media during study hours to enhance 
focus and attention.
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A book chapter “Knockdown Factor (KDF) in Laminated 
Composite Cylindrical Shells with Geometric Imperfections”, 
authored by Mr. Ayan Dutta, Dr. Rohan Majumder 
(FEST-Faculty) & Dr. Sudib Kumar Mishra. The influence of 
geometric dimple imperfection and delamination on KDFs of 
laminated cylindrical shell is investigated in this study. The 
research also highlights the sensitivity of KDFs concerning the 
laminate stacking sequence. 
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Read more

https://link.springer.com/chapter/10.1007/978-981-96-8464-9_41


The research paper titled “Fraud Lock 360: Global Comparison 
and a Secret Key Solution using QuadLock Algorithm” was 
presented at International Financial Security & Management 
Conference (FINCON) 2025 by Dr. Ritu Patidar (Faculty-FEST) 
and Ms. Priya Shah, (Student-Student). The conference was 
organized by National Forensic Sciences University (NFSU), 
Gandhinagar, Gujarat. The presented research paper received the 
best paper award (second prize) along with a cash prize of 
₹10,000, recognizing its exceptional contribution to financial 
security research. 
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A guest lecture on “Innovation in the Energy Sector: Entrepreneur 
to Fill the Gap” was organized by the Entrepreneur Development 
Cell (IIC) of Shri Sant Gajanan Maharaj College of Engineering, 
Shegaon. The session was delivered by Dr. Subhanarayan Sahoo 
(Faculty-FEST). During his talk, Dr. Sahoo highlighted the 
important role entrepreneurs play in bringing new ideas and 
innovation to the energy sector. He explained that the energy 
industry is currently shifting towards more sustainable and 
environment-friendly solutions. 
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